

Site Name: C0024 Hole Name: C0024A Lat: 33° 02' 02.6379"N Long: 136° 47' 23.9464"E Seabed Depth: 3,870.0 mBRT RT-MSL: 28.5 m Report Date: 9/Mar/2019
 Depth: @24:00 4,688.5 mBRT 818.5 mbsf Progress: 297.5 m Drilling/Coring/Underreaming Hrs.: 13.74 hrs Last BOP FT: - Next BOP FT: -
 Depth: @06:00 4,728.0 mBRT 858.0 mbsf LAST CASING: x mbsf (mBRT) Last BOP FT: - Next BOP FT: -
 Summary of Operation on 8-Mar: Cont. to drill down 8-1/2" LWD hole at 4,688.5mBRT. Take survey. Perform NSD connection.
 Present Operation @ 06:00 on 9-Mar: Ream up and down to confirm hole condition. mBRT: meter below rotary table mbsf: meter below sea floor

From	To	Hrs	Code	Depth(mBRT)	Detail of Operation
0:00	1:45	1:45	DRL	4,421.0	Continue to drill 8-1/2" LWD hole from 4,391mBRT to 4,421mBRT (Vessel move 1.5m/10min toward to DP/RGR contacted direction for RGR rotation smoothly) WOB: 0-60kN, HPS:110rpm x 0-14kNm, SPP:500gpm x 10.6MPa, Set Auto driller:21m/hr, Pump sweep 5m3 x 2times per stand(SPP:8.8MPa then back to normal)
1:45	2:00	0:15	OTHER	4,421.0	Take survey #14
2:00	2:30	0:30	OTHER	4,421.0	Perform NSD connection. Vessel move toward to opposite way from DP/RGR contacted position and stop vessel 10m away from well center.
2:30	4:15	1:45	DRL	4,460.0	Continue to drill 8-1/2" LWD hole from 4,421mBRT to 4,460mBRT (Vessel move 1.5m/10min toward to DP/RGR contacted direction for RGR rotation smoothly) WOB: 0-40kN, HPS:110rpm x 0-12kNm, SPP:500gpm x 10.5MPa, Set Auto driller:21m/hr, Pump sweep 5m3 x 2times per stand(SPP:9.6MPa then back to normal)
4:15	4:30	0:15	OTHER	4,460.0	Take survey #15
4:30	5:00	0:30	OTHER	4,460.0	Perform NSD connection. Vessel move toward to opposite way from DP/RGR contacted position and stop vessel 10m away from well center.
5:00	7:15	2:15	DRL	4,499.0	Continue to drill 8-1/2" LWD hole from 4,460mBRT to 4,499mBRT (Vessel move 1.5m/10min toward to DP/RGR contacted direction for RGR rotation smoothly) WOB: 0-30kN, HPS:110rpm x 0-16kNm, SPP:500gpm x 10.7MPa, Set Auto driller:21m/hr, Pump sweep 5m3 x 2times per stand(SPP:9.3MPa then back to normal)
7:15	7:30	0:15	OTHER	4,499.0	Take survey #16
7:30	8:00	0:30	OTHER	4,499.0	Perform NSD connection. Vessel move toward to opposite way from DP/RGR contacted position and stop vessel 10m away from well center.
8:00	9:45	1:45	DRL	4,535.0	Continue to drill 8-1/2" LWD hole from 4,499mBRT to 4,535mBRT (Vessel move 1.5m/10min toward to DP/RGR contacted direction for RGR rotation smoothly) WOB: 0-40kN, HPS:110rpm x 0-16kNm, SPP:540gpm x 12.2MPa, Set Auto driller:21m/hr, Pump sweep 5m3 x 2times per stand(SPP:11.1MPa then back to normal)
9:45	10:00	0:15	OTHER	4,535.0	Take survey #17
10:00	10:30	0:30	OTHER	4,535.0	Perform NSD connection. Vessel move toward to opposite way from DP/RGR contacted position and stop vessel 10m away from well center.
10:30	12:15	1:45	DRL	4,577.0	Continue to drill 8-1/2" LWD hole from 4,535mBRT to 4,577mBRT (Vessel move 1.5m/10min toward to DP/RGR contacted direction for RGR rotation smoothly) WOB: 0-40kN, HPS:110rpm x 0-20kNm, SPP:540gpm x 12.5MPa, Set Auto driller:21m/hr, Pump sweep 5m3 x 2times per stand(SPP:11.3MPa then back to normal) Observe ECD increase from 1.055sg to 1.083sg at 4,569mBRT(699mbsf). ECD decrease to 1.049sg with drilling down.
12:15	12:45	0:30	OTHER	4,577.0	Take survey #18
12:45	15:00	2:15	DRL	4,616.0	Continue to drill 8-1/2" LWD hole from 4,577mBRT to 4,616mBRT (Vessel move 1.5m/10min toward to DP/RGR contacted direction for RGR rotation smoothly) WOB: 0-90kN, HPS:110rpm x 0-18kNm, SPP:540gpm x 12.7MPa, Set Auto driller:21m/hr, Pump sweep 5m3 x 2times per stand(SPP:11.5MPa then back to normal) Observe long period swell affect to high WOB and torque
15:00	15:30	0:30	OTHER	4,616.0	Take survey #19
15:30	19:00	3:30	DRL	4,655.5	Continue to drill 8-1/2" LWD hole from 4,616mBRT to 4,655.5mBRT (Vessel move 1.5m/10min toward to DP/RGR contacted direction for RGR rotation smoothly) (From 4,616mBRT to 4,626mBRT) WOB: 0-50kN, HPS:110rpm x 0-18kNm, SPP:540gpm x 12.5MPa, Set Auto driller:21m/hr, Pump sweep 10m3 x 1time At 4,626mBRT, when all 10m3 sweep come out from bit, observe torque and pressure increase to 26kNm and 18MPa (Downhole ECD increase from 1.05sg to 1.11sg) Reciprocate x 2times until torque and pressure decrease to 4-10kNm(120rpm) and 14.6MPa(540gpm) then pump sweep 5m3 Continue reciprocate x 7times while pumping sweep w/70rpm x 2-4kNm, 540gpm x 12.5MPa (confirm ECD back to 1.05sg) (From 4,626mBRT to 4,655.5mBRT) WOB: 0-70kN, HPS:110rpm x 0-19kNm, SPP:540gpm x 12.5MPa, Set Auto driller:21m/hr, Pump sweep 5m3 x 1time(SPP:11.2MPa then back to normal)
19:00	19:30	0:30	OTHER	4,655.5	Take survey #20
19:30	24:00	4:30	DRL	4,688.5	Continue to drill 8-1/2" LWD hole from 4,655.5mBRT to 4,688.5mBRT (Vessel move 1.5m/10min toward to DP/RGR contacted direction for RGR rotation smoothly) (From 4,656mBRT to 4,660mBRT) WOB: 0-30kN, HPS:110rpm x 0-15kNm, SPP:540gpm x 12.5MPa, Set Auto driller:21m/hr, Pump sweep 5m3 x 1time At 4,660mBRT, observe torque and pressure increase to 22kNm(110rpm) and 15MPa(540gpm). Downhole ECD increase from 1.05sg to 1.10sg. Reaming up and down x 3times until torque and pressure decrease to 2-9kNm(110rpm) and 12.2MPa(540gpm) While reciprocating, suddenly encounter stall out >26kNm then observe pressure increase to 18MPa and stop pump. Downhole ECD 1.10sg. PU w/100kN then start rotate(confirm pipe free w/60rpm x 3-10kNm) then start pump 540gpm x 13.5MPa Pump sweep 5m3 and continue reciprocate x 1time w/90-110rpm x 2-10kNm, 540gpm x 11-13MPa(confirm ECD back to 1.05sg) (From 4,660mBRT to 4,688.5mBRT) Change Auto driller setting WOB: 0kN, HPS:110rpm x 0-12kNm, SPP:540gpm x 12.9MPa, Set Auto driller:15m/hr, Pump sweep 5m3 x 2times(SPP:11MPa then back to normal) At 4,688.5mBRT, observe torque and pressure increase to 26kNm and 15MPa (Downhole ECD increase from 1.05sg to 1.10sg) PU string 10m w/110rpm x 15-26kNm and 540gpm x 15-18MPa(ECD continue increase gradually to 1.17sg) then reduce rotation speed to 80rpm Ream up and down 1time, observe torque and pressure decrease to 4-12kNm(80rpm) and 15.5MPa(540gpm). ECD decrease from 1.17sg to 1.10sg then pump sweep 3m3 Continue to reciprocate while pumping sweep w/80rpm x 3-9kNm, 540gpm x 14.6-15.3MPa. Ongoing(Downhole ECD 1.10sg)

No	Depth (mBRT)	Inc (deg)	Azi (deg)
#14	4,403.00	5.52	262.02
#15	4,442.09	5.79	263.71
#16	4,481.48	6.33	263.42
#17	4,520.43	6.69	264.04
#18	4,559.50	6.97	261.56
#19	4,598.69	7.31	265.11
#20	4,637.50	7.84	264.94

From	To	Hrs	Code	Depth(mBRT)	Detail of Operation
0:00	2:30	2:30	OTHER	4,688.5	Continue to reaming up and down from 4,656mBRT to 4,688.5mBRT Ream up and down full stand while pumping sweep w/80rpm x 3-9kNm, 540gpm x 9.9-18.3MPa (ECD: 1.11sg). Observe drag 150kN at 4,677-4,674mBRT and 4,669mBRT After reaming full stand for 3 times, SPP and ECD decrease to 9.9MPa and 1.052sg. Pump 10m3 of KNPP mud. When mud come out from nozzle, string packed off at 4,677mBRT and ECD increase to 1.194sg. Stop pump and release torque. Apply overpull 400kN and confirm string free. PU and string packed off again at 4,671mBRT. Apply overpull 200kN and confirm string free. Reaming up and down full stand for 3 times and confirm ECD decrease from 1.12sg to 1.057sg and SPP from 13.3MPa to 11.2MPa.
2:30	3:00	0:30	DRL	4,695.5	Continue to drill 8-1/2" LWD hole from 4,688.5mBRT to 4,695.5mBRT (Vessel move 1.5m/10min toward to DP/RGR contacted direction for RGR rotation smoothly) WOB: 0-20kN, HPS:110rpm x 0-12kNm, SPP:540gpm x 12.7MPa, Set Auto driller:15m/hr.
3:00	3:30	0:30	OTHER	4,695.5	Take survey #21
3:30	6:00	2:30	DRL	4,728.0	Continue to drill 8-1/2" LWD hole from 4,695.5mBRT to 4,728mBRT (Vessel move 1.5m/10min toward to DP/RGR contacted direction for RGR rotation smoothly) WOB: 0-40kN, HPS:110rpm x 0-16kNm, SPP:540gpm x 13.3MPa, Set Auto driller:21m/hr, Pump sweep 3m3 x 3times per stand(SPP:11.5MPa then back to normal) ECD increase at 4,715mBRT. Reaming up and down and confirm ECD decrease to 1.069sg. Resume drilling and ECD decrease to 1.059sg with drilling down. Observe Torque and SPP increasing at 4,728mBRT (ECD: 1.17sg). Reaming up and down, on going.

No	Depth (mBRT)	Inc (deg)	Azi (deg)
#21	4,677.27	8.43	264.38

Bit Record @24:00

Bit No.	Size (in)	MFR	Type	IADC Code	S/No.	Nozzles	Depth (mBRT)	Meterage	Hrs.	WOB (kN)	rpm	Total Rev. (krev)	ROP (m/hr)	Inner	Outer	Dull Condition
13	8.5	Smith	MD516UBPXG	M223	QF3594	2 x 11/32, 3 x 15/32	3,870.0 - 4,688.5	818.5	35.27	0 - 90	30 - 120	191.67	23.9			

BHA Record @24:00

34	LWD	8-1/2" Bit x MicroScope 675 x ArcVision675 x TeleScope675 x SonicScope675 x seismicVision675 x XO#1 x float sub (non-ported sub) x XO#2
		6-3/4" DC (4 IF) (2sets) x XO#3 x 6-3/4" DC (4-1/2 IF) (1std) x 6-1/2" Jar x 6-3/4" DC (1std) x XO#4 x 5.68"HWDP (3sets)

Mud Properties @24:00

Mud Type	Time	Depth (mBRT)	MW	VIS	PV	YV	8rpm	Gel St. (10 ⁻¹⁰)	API	Cake	pH	PI	Cl-	Sand	Oil	Solid	MBC	Temp In	Temp Out	K+	n	K	LGS	FIT 20/40 (mm) 0 min / 5min
KNPP	7:30	Act#4	1.35	51	22	16		4	11		12.2							18		0.66	0.62			
KNPP	8:00	Res#2	1.36	32	23	17		4	12		12.2							17		0.66	0.67			

Mud Pumps - 14-P-220

No.	Liner Size	SPM	GPM	Press. (MPa)	Ann. Vel. (m/min)
1	6"	54	270		5.5 DP
2	6"	54	270	18.0	54
3	6"	0	0		60

Geologic Information @24:00

From	To	Lithology of cuttings

Shale Shaker / Centrifuge @24:00

No.	30, 60	No.4	30, 60	#1-#3 Centrifuge running time
No.2	30, 60	No.5	30, 60	
No.3	30, 60	No.6	30, 60	

Materials Stock on Board @24:00

Item	Unit	Stock	Used	Received
Fresh Water	m3	287.8	90.6	97.9
Potable Water	m3	188.9	6.9	0.0
Drill Water	m3	893.0	17.6	0.0
Fuel	m3	1,904.8	47.5	0.0
Lube Oil	Ltrs	47,100	500.0	0.0
Hell Fuel	Ltrs	0.0	0.0	0.0
Cement "GWC"	ton	160.0	0.0	0.0
Cement "G"	ton	30.0	0.0	0.0

Boat Information @24:00

Boat Name	Status	Time @Chikyu
#8 Meiji-maru	Katsura	15:00
Shincho-maru	Chikyu	23:30

Weather Information

Time	Weather	Temp. (degC)	Barometer	Wind	Wave	Current	Visibility
24:00	bc	12.0	1027.0	0.6 / 350 / 1.0	2.3 / 355 / 8.0	0.1 / 147	22.0

Today's Schedule: Continue to drill down 8-1/2" LWD hole.

Reported by: N. Sakurai / T. Nishiyama
Approved by: T. Saruhashi