_	DAILY		NG REF		<u></u>	44 024
Depth :	@24:00 @06:00	7,705.5 7,715.0	mBRT 77	8.0 mbsf	sf Progress : 66.5 m Drilling/Coring/Underreaming Hrs. : 24.00 hrs sf LAST CASING : x mbsf(mBRT)	
Pre Ti	sent Opera	tion @ 06:00	n on 19. 0 on 20 . - 24:00 on	-Oct :		=
From 0:00	To 0:45	Hrs 0:45	Code	Depth(mBRT)		
0:45	3:00	2:15	CORE	7,648.5	Cut C0019J #67K(SDRCB) core from 7,639.0 - 7,648.5mBRT (711.5 - 721.0mbsf) 7,639.0 - 7,648.5mBRT (711.5 - 721.0mbsf), MP 450gpm x 9.2-9.8MPa, HPS 90rpm x 0.1-12.0kNm, WOB 10-65kN, Auto ROP 40m/hr Observe pressure increases to 9.8MPa from 9.4MPa at 7,645.5mBRT Load and run sinker bar. Recover inner barrel.	
3:00	4:15	1:15	CORE	7,648.5	Drop C0019J #68K(SDRCB) inner barrel. Unload sinker bar after drop inner barrel. Pump 10m3 SWG w/275gpm and confirm inner barrel landing by increasing pressure from 2.8 to 4.4MPa w/275gpm 35min after dropping.	
4:15	7:00	2:45	CORE	7,658.0	Sweep out SWG w/650gpm x 19.5MPa. Cut C0019J #68K(SDRCB) core from 7,648.5 - 7,658.0mBRT (721.0 - 730.5mbsf) 7,648.5 - 7,658.0mBRT (721.0 - 730.5mbsf), MP 450gpm x 9.2-10.0MPa, HPS 90-100rpm x 0.1-11.0kNm, WOB 10-80kN, Auto ROP 40-30m/hr Reduce ROP setting to 30m/hr from 40m/hr and increase HPS speed to 100rpm from 90rpm.	•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••
7:00	8:15	1:15	CORE	7,658.0	Observe pressure increases to 10.0MPa from 9.5MPa at 7,653.0mBRT. Load and run sinker bar. Recover inner barrel. Drop C0019J #69K(SDRCB) inner barrel. Unload sinker bar after drop inner barrel.	
8:15	10:45	2:30	CORE	7,667.5	Pump SWG 10m3 w/275gpm and Confirm inner barrel landing by increasing pressure from 2.8 to 4.5MPa w/275gpm 35min after dropping. Sweep out SWG w/650gpm x 19.4MPa Cut C0019J #69K(SDRCB) core from 7,658.0 - 7,667.5mBRT (730.5 - 740.0mbsf)	
10:45	12:00	1:15	CORE	7 667 5	7,658.0 - 7,667.5mBRT (730.5 - 740.0mbsf), MP 450gpm x 9.2-10.0MPa, HPS 90rpm x 0.1-12.8kNm, WOB 10-55kN, Auto ROP 40m/hr Observe pressure increases to 10.0MPa from 9.5MPa at 7,664.5mBRT. Load and run sinker bar, then recover inner barrel. Drop C0019J #70K(SDRCB) inner barrel.	
					Unload sinker bar after drop inner barrel. Pump 10m3 of SWG w/275gpm. Confirm inner barrel landing by increasing pressure from 2.7 to 4.5MPa w/275gpm 36min after dropping. Then sweep out SWG w/650gpm x 19.6MPa	
12:00	14:45	2:45	CORE	7,677.0	Cut C0019J #70K(SDRCB) core from 7,667.5 - 7,677.0mBRT (740.0 - 749.5mbsf) 7,667.5 - 7,677.0mBRT (740.0 - 749.5mbsf), MP 450gpm x 9.2-9.9MPa, HPS 90rpm x 0.1-11.7kNm, WOB 10-110kN, Auto ROP 40m/hr Observe pressure increases to 9.9MPa from 9.5MPa at 7,673.0mBRT. Load and run sinker bar. Recover inner barrel.	
14:45	16:00	1:15	CORE	7,677.0	Drop C0019J #71K(SDRCB) inner barrel. Unload sinker bar after drop inner barrel. Pump SWG 10m3 then make drill pipe stand connection Pump w/275gpm and confirm inner barrel landing by increasing pressure from 2.9 to 4.5MPa w/275gpm 43min after dropping. Sweep out SWG w/650gpm x 20.0MPa.	
16:00	18:45	2:45	CORE	7,686.5	Cut C0019J #71K(SDRCB) core from 7,677.0 - 7,686.5mBRT (749.5 - 759.0mbsf) 7,677.0 - 7,686.5mBRT (749.5 - 759.0mbsf), MP 450gpm x 9.2-13.4MPa, HPS 90rpm x 0.1-13.0kNm, WOB 10-65kN, Auto ROP 40m/hr Observe pressure increases to 10.0MPa from 9.5MPa at 7,681.5mBRT. Observe pressure increases to 13.2MPa from 10.0MPa at 7,686.5mBRT. Decrease pump rate 450gpm => 150gpm and pump pressure 2.3MPa* *0.8MPa higher than last #70 and suspect bit was plugged patially.	
18:45	19:45	1:00	CORE	7,686.5	Load and run sinker bar. Recover inner barrel. Drop C0019J #72K(SDRCB) inner barrel. Unload sinker bar after drop inner barrel. Pump SWG 10m3 w/275gpm and confirm inner barrel landing by increasing pressure from 3.2 to 4.7MPa w/275gpm 34min after dropping.	
19:45	22:30	2:45	CORE	7,696.0	Sweep out SWG w/650gpm x 21.0MPa. *Confirm center of bit was not plugged by pump pressure while chasing inner barrel. Cut C0019J #72K(SDRCB) core from 7,686.5 - 7,696.0mBRT (759.0 - 768.5mbsf) 7,686.5 - 7,696.0mBRT (759.0 - 768.5mbsf), MP 450gpm x 9.2-10.2MPa, HPS 90rpm x 0.1-13.0kNm, WOB 10-80kN, Auto ROP 40m/hr	
22:30	23:30	1:00	CORE	7,696.0	No observation of pressure increase while coring. Load and run sinker bar. Recover inner barrel. Drop C0019J #73K(SDRCB) inner barrel.	
23:30	24:00	0:30	CORE	7,705.5	Unload sinker bar after drop inner barrel. Pump SWG 10m3 w/275gpm and confirm inner barrel landing by increasing pressure from 3.5 to 5.2MPa w/275gpm 34min after dropping. Sweep out SWG w/650gpm x 19.5MPa. Cut C0019J #73K(SDRCB) core from 7,696.0 - 7,705.5mBRT (768.5 - 778.0mbsf)	
					7,696.0 - 7,705.5mBRT (768.5 - 778.0mbsf), MP 450gpm x 9.2-9.7MPa, HPS 90rpm x 0.1-11.0kNm, WOB 10-55kN, Auto ROP 40m/hr No observation of pressure increase while coring.	
т	ime Breakd	own (00:00 -	· 06:00 on	20-Oct	Meanwhile, (08:30-24:00)Advisory status due to over 18m/s wind speed.) *The data on 00:00 - 06:00 is unofficial.	
From 0:00	To 2:15	Hrs. 2:15	Code	Depth(mBRT)		
2:15	3:30	1:15	CORE	7,705.5	Drop C0019J #74K(SDRCB) inner barrel. Unload sinker bar after drop inner barrel. Pump SWG 10m3 w/275gpm and confirm inner barrel landing by increasing pressure from 3.6 to 5.5MPa w/275gpm 35min after dropping. Sweep out SWG w/650gpm x 19.6MPa.	***************************************
3:30	6:00	2:30	CORE	7,715.0	Check pressure at 275gpm before starting coring and pressure is 4.7MPa (Same as normal), and confirm nozzle or bit is plugged after coring. Cut C0019J #74K(SDRCB) core from 7,705.5 - 7,715.0mBRT (778.0 - 787.5mbsf) 7,705.5 - 7,715.0mBRT (778.0 - 787.5mbsf), MP 450gpm x 9.4-10.5MPa, HPS 90rpm x 0.1-12.2kNm, WOB 10-85kN, Auto ROP 40m/hr Observe pressure increases to 10.5MPa from 9.7MPa at 7,713.5mBRT.	•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••
Bit Record					Load and run sinker bar. Recover inner barrel, ongoing.	
No. (in)		vne i	ode	Nozzles Depth (mBRT) Meter- From To age Hrs. WOB (kN) rpm Total Rev. ROP Dull Condition	RP
BHA Reco	rd @24:00 SDRCB	2			Hook Wt. (knt) @24:00 7,705.5 Hook Load	4,120
	05.105	x XO#3 x 5	"DP S-140 (6	66stds) x 5-1	1/2"DP S-140 (22stds) x XO#4 x 5-1/2"DP S-150 (25stds) x XO#5 x 5-1/2"DP UD-165 (30stds) x XO#6 x 6-5/8"DP Z-140 (13stds) x 6-5/8"DP UD-165 BHA Below Jar HPS & Traveling block	140 680
Mud Prope Mud Type	rties @24:0 Time	Depth (mBRT)	MW VIS	PV YV	CSG/TBG Cal St	hrs
Mind Dines	a - 14 D 220		F.00	gallan/atroko	Motor Pumping time @24:00 S/N: Today Total	hrs
No. Line		PM G	PM I	ess. Ann 1Pa) (m/	in. Vel. MarE3 5 Item Received Used Stock Fit. Time Pas n/min) MQJ Crew 101 Barite 76,000 No. Arrived Departed Are.	senger Dept
2 4	6" 6"	65 3		1.0	Scientist 25 Caustic soda 275 7,850 2	
Ite Fresh Wate		Unit St	251.0	59.7	JAMSTEC PR Flowzan 25 Akatsuki (Supply boat) Status Standby at Chikyu sceived 39.7 PHG (m3) 185 Heave (m) 0.2 HSQE and other information	
Potable Wa Drill Water Fuel		m3 1, m3 5,	219.0 295.0 164.1	2.0 0.0 39.8	0.0 Sub-contractor Kill mud (m3) 48 Pitch (deg) 0.2 Incident Last Incident No. LT 0.0 Sub-contractor SWG (m3) 131 Roll (deg) 0.1 LTI 11/14/19 0.0 Pre-Mix (m3) 60 Vessel Heading (deg) 155 HUNS cards 57	<u> </u>
Lube, Oil Heli Fuel			9,600	0.0	0.0 Expro Riser Tension (kN) - Remarks 0.0 NuStar 3 V.D. Load (ton) 14024 GE Max Draught (m) 9.0 Total 154 Thruster (kW) 1200	
Weather In	formation Weather	Temp Air	. (degC)	Barometer (hPa)	Well Cost (1,000 Yen) based on the cost by	
24:00 Today':	bc s Schedule:	22.0	25.5	1021.5		